August 8, 2008
Hawthorne, New Jersey

Bids were received on the above date at 11:15 a.m.
Present was Borough Clerk Jean Mele, Borough Administrator
Eric Maurer.

Mrs. Mele asked if anyone had a proposal that had not
yet been turned in, would they now hand it in at this time,
or the time for receiving bids is closed.

REPAIR OF POLICE VEHICLEWS

Arthur M. Lieberman, General Manager
All American Ford
520 River Street
Hackensack, New Jersgey 07601
No Bid Bond Required
1. Per Hour Labor Rate
a. Police Vehicles, Other Passenger Vehicles &

Light trucks $54.50
b. Diagnostic Labor for Computerized Control
Systems: $54.50
2. Parts to be supplied on the following basis:
a. Retail price less discount of: 35%

3. Lump Sum Price for 0il Change (including oil,
filter and lube, with labor):
a. Police Cars with Synthetic 0il

(up to 7 gts. oil) $59.95
b. Other Passenger Vehicles & Light Trucks
(up to 5 gts. 0il) $19.25

D & K Enterprises, Inc.
t/a Hawthorne Auto Lab
225 Diamond Bridge Avenue
Hawthorne, NJ 07506
No Bid Bond Required
1. Per Hour Labor Rate
a. Police Vehicles, Other Passenger Vehicles &

Light trucks $88.00
b. Diagnostic Labor for Computerized Control
Systems: $95.00
2. Parts to be supplied on the following basis:
a. Retail price less discount of: 10%

3. Lump Sum Price for 0il Change (including oil,
filter and lube, with labor) :
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a. Police Cars with Synthetic 0il

(up to 7 gts. oil) $55.99
b. Other Passenger Vehicles & Light Trucks
(up to 5 gte. ©il) $26.95
Ken Smith Motors Inc.
15 Franklin Avenue
Ridgewood, New Jersey 07450
No Bid Bond Required
1. Per Hour Labor Rate
a. Police Vehicles, Other Passenger Vehicles &
Light trucks $75.00
b. Diagnostic Labor for Computerized Control
Systems: $75.00
2. Parts to be supplied on the following basis:
a. Retail price less discount of: 25%
3. Lump Sum Price for 0il Change (including oil,
filter and lube, with labor):
a. Police Cars with Synthetic 0il
(up to 7 gts. oil) $32.50
b. Other Passenger Vehicles & Light Trucks
(up to 5 gts. 0il) $22.00
Luscher’s Automotive
20 Fourth Avenue
Hawthorne, New Jersey 07506
No Bid Bond Required
1. Per Hour Labor Rate
a. Police Vehicles, Other Passenger Vehicles &
Light trucks $74.08
b. Diagnostic Labor for Computerized Control
Systems: $74.08
2. Parts to be supplied on the following basis:
a. Retail price less discount of: 15%
3. Lump Sum Price for 0il Change (including oil,
filter and lube, with labor) :
a. Police Cars with Synthetic 0il
(up to 7 gts. oil) 550.52
Synthetic blend (7gts) $34.82
b. Other Passenger Vehicles & Light Trucks
(up to 5 gts. 0il) $23.08
Richard Goldberg Jean Mele
Council Presgident Borough Clerk
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